

PLAINTIFF'S EXHIBIT 1

In The Case Of

*Heather Maxin, Individually and on Behalf of All Others Similarly
Situated,*

v

RHG & Company, Inc.,

16-cv-2625 JLS (BLM)

KAZEROUNI LAW GROUP, APC
245 FISCHER AVENUE, UNIT D1
COSTA MESA, CA 92626
(800) 400-6808

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

Hyde & Swigart	\$23,407.00
Joshua B. Swigart, ATTORNEY (AT \$625.00 per hr.)	
<i>April 28, 2015</i>	
Conf Call with with co-counsel re testing results	0.70 hrs.
<i>April 30, 2015</i>	
Prepared memo re moving forward with this action and anticipated defenses	2.20 hrs.
<i>June 2, 2015</i>	
Discussed case with client and AK	1.10 hrs.
<i>June 3, 2015</i>	
Edited complaint	0.90 hrs.
<i>June 25, 2015</i>	
Conf call with co counsel	0.60 hrs.
<i>July 8, 2015</i>	
Call with client re proposed mediation	0.70 hrs.
<i>July 15, 2015</i>	
Discussed mediators with co-counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>July 20, 2015</i>	
Conducted research and outlined potential settlement parameters	2.80 hrs.
<i>August 26, 2015</i>	
Call with co-counsel	0.50 hrs.
<i>November 24, 2015</i>	
Call with co-counsel re status of getting case into mediation	0.40 hrs.
Incorporate changes to Settlement Agreement and continue editing	3.10 hrs.
<i>November 27, 2015</i>	
Travel to OC to meet with AK re case	2.20 hrs.
Meet with AK re moving case forward	2.80 hrs.
Returned to SD following meeting	2.60 hrs.
<i>February 18, 2016</i>	
Reviewed Ds changes. Conducted research on said changes and prepared counter proposal for d counsel	2.10 hrs.
<i>February 25, 2016</i>	
Conference call with AK re D's redlines to the SA and their letters	0.40 hrs.
<i>May 26, 2016</i>	
Review new motion for preliminary approval	1.00 hrs.
<i>May 27, 2016</i>	
Review updated version for preliminary approval	0.50 hrs.
<i>July 18, 2016</i>	
Reviewed D counsels changes to preliminary approval motion and made further edits	2.40 hrs.
<i>October 24, 2016</i>	
Met with client re preliminary approval papers	0.80 hrs.

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

<i>October 26, 2016</i>	Final edits to P&A	1.80 hrs.
<i>February 14, 2017</i>	Review file	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 13, 2017</i>	Discussed ex parte order with co counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>November 1, 2017</i>	Edited fee petition	2.60 hrs.
<i>November 3, 2017</i>	Met with client	0.60 hrs.
<i>November 8, 2017</i>	Updated fee petition	4.90 hrs.

Joshua B. Swigart, In Summary:	<u>\$23,394.50</u>	<u>38.70 hrs.</u>
--------------------------------	--------------------	-------------------

Front Desk, FRONT DESK (AT \$125.00 per hr.)

<i>July 9, 2015</i>	Soft File Created	0.00 hrs.
<i>October 13, 2016</i>	Received D's responses to P's Srogs	0.10 hrs.

Front Desk, In Summary:	<u>\$12.50</u>	<u>0.10 hrs.</u>
-------------------------	----------------	------------------

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

Kaz LG		\$78,211.00
Andrei Armas, ATTORNEY (AT \$295.00 per hr.)		
<i>November 24, 2015</i>		
Conference call between class counsel re settlement conference		0.30 hrs.
	Andrei Armas, In Summary:	\$175.50
		0.30 hrs.
Abbas Kazerounian, ATTORNEY (AT \$625.00 per hr.)		
<i>April 24, 2015</i>		
Conversation with consultant		2.10 hrs.
Email to assistant re testing		0.20 hrs.
<i>April 27, 2015</i>		
Conf call with lab and consultant		0.80 hrs.
<i>April 28, 2015</i>		
Call with client		0.40 hrs.
Conf call with co counsel re testing		0.70 hrs.
<i>May 5, 2015</i>		
Results came back from lab. Made notes and sent email to consultant		0.60 hrs.
Call with consultant re results		1.60 hrs.
Call with co counsel re case		0.40 hrs.
<i>May 6, 2015</i>		
Meeting with ML re COA and research CA & Fed law re labeling		2.20 hrs.
<i>May 8, 2015</i>		
Reviewed memo by ML and redlined and emailed back		1.10 hrs.
<i>June 1, 2015</i>		
received draft of CLRA letter from ML. Read and redlined		0.70 hrs.
<i>June 2, 2015</i>		
Travel to SD to meet with client		2.10 hrs.
Discussed case with client and JBS		1.10 hrs.
Returned to OC following meeting with client		2.10 hrs.
<i>June 3, 2015</i>		
Finalized CLRA and sent off		0.20 hrs.
Drafted complaint		3.70 hrs.
<i>June 25, 2015</i>		
Call with Δ counsel re CLRA		0.40 hrs.
Conf call with consultant and co-counsel		0.60 hrs.
<i>June 26, 2015</i>		
Update with client		0.40 hrs.
<i>June 29, 2015</i>		
Letter via email to Δ counsel re our position on case & further email exchanges		0.80 hrs.
Conf call with co-counsel re Δ response		0.80 hrs.
<i>July 8, 2015</i>		
Call and email exchange with Δ counsel		0.40 hrs.

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

<i>July 9, 2015</i>	
Δ contacted me to tell me that they agree to class mediation	0.20 hrs.
conf call with co counsel re mediation	0.40 hrs.
<i>July 15, 2015</i>	
Research on mediators	2.40 hrs.
<i>August 8, 2015</i>	
Called JW re dates for Judge Papas	0.20 hrs.
Emailed Δ counsel dates for judge Papas	0.10 hrs.
<i>August 10, 2015</i>	
Call with client re potential mediation dates and what to expect from mediation	0.60 hrs.
<i>August 19, 2015</i>	
Discussed mediators with co-counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>August 26, 2015</i>	
Conf call with Δ counsel re mediation and type of settlement	0.50 hrs.
<i>August 27, 2015</i>	
Researched previous similar settlements	4.60 hrs.
<i>November 24, 2015</i>	
Call with co-counsel re status of getting case into mediation	0.40 hrs.
<i>November 25, 2015</i>	
Review and edit settlement agreement	4.20 hrs.
<i>November 27, 2015</i>	
Meet with JBS re moving case forward	2.80 hrs.
<i>December 11, 2015</i>	
Discussed exhibits with D counsel	0.20 hrs.
<i>December 19, 2015</i>	
Received edits to settlement docs from D counsel. Conducted legal research re other settlements and updated documents	2.70 hrs.
<i>December 29, 2015</i>	
Continued work on settlement documents	3.10 hrs.
<i>January 5, 2016</i>	
Reviewed d counsel's edits to settlement agreement and made updates	1.70 hrs.
<i>January 6, 2016</i>	
Call with co counsel re d's edits	0.20 hrs.
<i>January 8, 2016</i>	
Incorporate final edits to settlement docs and send to D counsel	1.90 hrs.
<i>January 25, 2016</i>	
Received new docs from D counsel re settlement. Reviewed and edited	1.20 hrs.
<i>January 29, 2016</i>	
Drafted and sent message to d counsel re our requested changes	1.30 hrs.
<i>February 25, 2016</i>	
Conf call with JBS re jx	0.40 hrs.

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

<i>March 8, 2016</i>	Research regarding d's case law citations	2.80 hrs.
<i>May 3, 2016</i>	Work on Preliminary Approval Motion	4.60 hrs.
<i>May 28, 2016</i>	Review Preliminary Approval motion from ML and docs	3.10 hrs.
<i>June 1, 2016</i>	Edit re updated preliminary approval motion	1.30 hrs.
	Call with KCC re serving as claim admin. discuss settlement parameters and notice requirements	0.30 hrs.
<i>June 24, 2016</i>	Drafted confirmatory discovery	1.70 hrs.
<i>August 3, 2016</i>	Call with D counsel re CAFA	0.20 hrs.
<i>August 28, 2016</i>	Conf call with D attorney re where the papers are and how to proceed	0.40 hrs.
<i>August 29, 2016</i>	Meeting with ML re the papers and how I want them and the strategy to file with D	1.70 hrs.
<i>September 2, 2016</i>	Call with D counsel	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 5, 2016</i>	Discussed settlement agreement with client	0.80 hrs.
<i>September 8, 2016</i>	Call with claims admin	0.80 hrs.
<i>September 9, 2016</i>	Call with client re case update	0.40 hrs.
<i>October 14, 2016</i>	Reviewed Ds SPROG responses and updated docs	2.80 hrs.
<i>October 24, 2016</i>	Edited P&A	2.10 hrs.
	Travel to SD to meet with client re preliminary approval papers	2.20 hrs.
	Met with client re preliminary approval papers	0.90 hrs.
	Returned to OC	2.80 hrs.
<i>October 28, 2016</i>	Discussed filing with Client	0.60 hrs.
<i>February 27, 2017</i>	Reviewed comprehensive 18 page prelim order. Made notes and sent to ML	0.90 hrs.
<i>February 28, 2017</i>	Updated client re granting of preliminary approval order and next steps	0.80 hrs.
<i>July 28, 2017</i>	Call with ML re case progress	0.20 hrs.

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

<i>August 29, 2017</i>	Research re preliminary approval schedule in conjunction with In re Mercury	3.10 hrs.
<i>September 1, 2017</i>	Discussed scheduling issues with D counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>September 11, 2017</i>	Received Order re Ex Parte - reviewed and made notes.	0.30 hrs.
<i>September 13, 2017</i>	Discussed ex parte order with co counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>September 14, 2017</i>	Reviewed case law re best way to provide supplemental notice to class members	0.80 hrs.
<i>September 15, 2017</i>	Call with KCC re most economic way to provide supp notice to class members	0.60 hrs.
<i>September 22, 2017</i>	Contacted D counsel to discuss next steps	0.20 hrs.
<i>October 27, 2017</i>	Discussed case status with client	0.40 hrs.
	Discussed case with OC	0.30 hrs.
<i>October 30, 2017</i>	Worked on Fee Petition	4.10 hrs.
<i>November 2, 2017</i>	Conducted research re recent fee petitions in CA	2.10 hrs.
<i>November 3, 2017</i>	Travel to SD to discuss fee petition with client and what to expect moving forward	2.30 hrs.
	meeting with client	0.60 hrs.
	Returned to OC following meeting with client	2.40 hrs.
<i>November 6, 2017</i>	Continued work on fee petition	3.90 hrs.
<i>November 10, 2017</i>	Finalized and filed fee petition	6.80 hrs.

Abbas Kazerounian, In Summary:	\$65,541.00	113.20 hrs.
--------------------------------	-------------	-------------

Joshua B. Swigart, ATTORNEY (AT \$625.00 per hr.)		
--	--	--

<i>May 5, 2015</i>	Call with co counsel re test results	0.40 hrs.
<i>January 6, 2016</i>	Call with co counsel re d's edits	0.20 hrs.

Joshua B. Swigart, In Summary:	\$363.00	0.60 hrs.
--------------------------------	----------	-----------

Matt Loker, ATTORNEY (AT \$495.00 per hr.)		
---	--	--

<i>April 23, 2015</i>	Conf call with client to review his complaints, the product and how options in moving forward	1.10 hrs.
<i>April 28, 2015</i>	Conf Call with with co-counsel re testing results	0.70 hrs.

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

<i>May 5, 2015</i>	
Call with client re lab results	0.60 hrs.
Call with co counsel re test results	0.40 hrs.
<i>May 6, 2015</i>	
Meeting with AK	2.20 hrs.
<i>May 7, 2015</i>	
Researched and drafted memo re moving forward	3.70 hrs.
<i>June 25, 2015</i>	
Conf call with co counsel	0.60 hrs.
<i>June 26, 2015</i>	
Update with client	0.60 hrs.
<i>July 15, 2015</i>	
Discussed mediators with co-counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>August 26, 2015</i>	
Call with co-counsel	0.50 hrs.
<i>October 21, 2015</i>	
Discussion with client re case progress	0.30 hrs.
<i>November 24, 2015</i>	
Contacted D counsel re status of moving forward with mediation	0.20 hrs.
Call with co-counsel re status of getting case into mediation	0.40 hrs.
<i>December 1, 2015</i>	
Discussed filing of Complaint with D counsel	0.20 hrs.
<i>December 4, 2015</i>	
Updated client re case progress	0.60 hrs.
<i>December 28, 2015</i>	
Edited settlement documents	1.10 hrs.
<i>January 6, 2016</i>	
Call with co counsel re d's edits	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 26, 2016</i>	
Call with client re case status	0.70 hrs.
<i>March 29, 2016</i>	
Call with D counsel re resolving issues with settlement agreement	0.20 hrs.
<i>May 13, 2016</i>	
Edit preliminary approval motion	1.70 hrs.
<i>May 26, 2016</i>	
Update preliminary approval motion	0.70 hrs.
<i>October 27, 2016</i>	
Confirmed that P&A was filed	0.20 hrs.
<i>February 21, 2017</i>	
Joint call with Cathy to chambers re oral. Patrick informed us that oral will come off if all parties agree. Cathy needed approval	0.30 hrs.

Time Sheets for Heather Maxin v. RHG & Company, Inc. dba Vtial Nutreints }

Call from Cathy - she agrees to vacate oral	0.20 hrs.
Joint call to chambers. Patrick confirmed that oral would come off	0.20 hrs.
<i>April 9, 2017</i>	
Received second status report from KCC	0.20 hrs.
<i>July 28, 2017</i>	
Call with AK re settlement progress	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 6, 2017</i>	
Drafted Ex Parte to modify notice and briefing schedule	1.20 hrs.
Reviewed Ds changes	0.20 hrs.
Prepared Proposed Order	0.20 hrs.
Filed Ex Parte	0.20 hrs.
Submitted Proposed Order	0.20 hrs.
<i>September 13, 2017</i>	
Discussed ex parte order with co counsel	0.40 hrs.
<i>September 15, 2017</i>	
Discussed supp notice with D counsel	0.40 hrs.
Prepared supp notice and sent to d counsel for review	0.90 hrs.
<i>September 18, 2017</i>	
Finalized and filed supp notice	0.40 hrs.
<i>September 21, 2017</i>	
Reviewed court order re fee petition and supp notice	0.20 hrs.
<i>October 27, 2017</i>	
Reviewed Order re case status	0.20 hrs.
<i>November 1, 2017</i>	
Edited joint report and sent approval to d counsel	0.60 hrs.
<i>November 5, 2017</i>	
Follow up call with client	0.30 hrs.
<i>November 7, 2017</i>	
Call with client re case status	0.20 hrs.
<i>November 8, 2017</i>	
Received scheduling order from the Court	0.20 hrs.
Conferred with D counsel re supplemental notice	0.20 hrs.
Reviewed edits to supp notice in conjunction with Court's order. Confirmed with D counsel that we have no further changes	0.40 hrs.

Matt Loker, In Summary:	\$12,131.50	24.80 hrs.
-------------------------	-------------	------------

Total Fees (For The Entire Firm): \$101,618.00